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Apple's stock has reason to trade 50% higher than its Friday price, Loup Ventures' ... Gene Munster, a former top Wall Street
tech analyst turned venture ... Apple currently has a multiple, or price-to-earnings ratio, around the mid-20s. ... “Ultimately, this
is a massive opportunity for Apple, huge play on 5G, but .... Loup Ventures managing partner Gene Munster recently joined ...
Share: Gene Munster On Apple's Future, Tesla's Valuation And The ... Munster discussed the latest on tech stocks including
Apple, Inc. (NASDAQ: AAPL) and Tesla, Inc. ... If the current administration does not change, there could be less risk .... The
Apple privacy policy looms large in the era of digital health data – and ... the opportunity in health care," said Gene Munster,
managing partner of Loup Ventures. ... Consumers might think existing health privacy laws limit the sharing of ... software are
not covered by HIPAA," added Swire, now a privacy .... Video Not Available ... With everyone wondering whether the price of
their Apple (AAPL) products ... Loup Ventures Managing Partner Gene Munster says he doesn't expect tariffs on Apple
products ... Shares of Apple jumped after the United States Trade ... China: looming risk or an opportunity for Apple?.
Longtime analyst Gene Munster sees a huge opportunity for Apple in ... the healthcare opportunity is not currently priced into
[Apple's] shares," .... By Gene Munster Tim Cook commented in a recent interview that their ... the healthcare opportunity is
not currently priced into shares of AAPL.. ... Gene Munster writes for LoupVentures. “We believe the healthcare opportunity is
not currently priced into shares of AAPL.” “Apple's approach .... My report on Apple's (AAPL) fiscal year 2019 was titled “The
Bad Year Ends.” ... The value proposition of relatively high priced Apple products is that you ... What is happening to Apple's
stock right now is something that Gene Munster has been ... Perhaps you think laid-off people lose access to health care?.
Former research analyst Gene Munster has been closely following Apple Inc. (NASDAQ: AAPL) for years and said the stock
still ... In addition, Apple should see continued growth in wearables based on current low ... Munster said the case for continued
upside in Apple's stock can also be ... Page Not Found.. 31 -- Gene Munster, managing partner and analyst at Loup Ventures,
explains why he sees Apple Inc. shares .... Over the weekend, longtime Apple (NASDAQ: AAPL) analyst turned venture
capitalist Gene Munster put out a research note to investors, which ... Munster believes that wearables will overtake the Mac in
terms of revenue in 2020. ... there is the potential that the current health crisis could have an impact on .... Gene Munster: 5G
won't boost Apple in 2020 as much as investors think ... “Ultimately, this is a massive opportunity for Apple, huge play on 5G,
but it's ... but Apple is not expected to release its first 5G iPhone until next year. ... Indeed, current iPhone users seem interested
in a 5G model, according to a .... Warren Buffett educated Steve Jobs and Tim Cook about the benefits of stock ... Gene
Munster: Apple's healthcare opportunity is not currently priced into AAPL .... According to Loup Ventures analyst Gene
Munster, Apple's ambitions to enter the healthcare market is "not currently priced into shares" yet. ... It is reckoned healthcare
accounts for 18 percent of the US gross domestic product, but despite the size, technology hasn't had much of an impact on the
industry.. Apple analyst Gene Munster of Loup Ventures recently tested the accuracy of ... Munster expects Apple to debut new
Siri, AR, AI, and Digital Health ... told CNBC that now remains a "golden opportunity" to buy Apple stock. ... Hamilton
maintained his "buy" rating for AAPL today, with a price target of $185.. Loup Ventures founder Gene Munster recently joined
PreMarket Prep ... which is currently trading at around 33 times earnings compared to just 24 ... Apple goes from free to pay in
2021, Disney maybe raises its prices, ... View More Analyst Ratings for AAPL ... Benzinga does not provide investment advice..
Renewed China Growth Can Lift Apple Stock in 2020 ... AAPL stock currently has a price-earnings ratio of 26.2. ... AAPL is
not in bubble territory, and any declines of AAPL stock due to ... Gene Munster does believe that 5G will be a “massive
opportunity for ... This Technology Is Transforming Healthcare.. Apple's growth potential is too low to justify its high valuation.
... it offers investors an opportunity to buy growth at a reasonable price. ... Loup Ventures analyst Gene Munster thinks Apple is
worth between $350 and $400 a share thinks to ... Such measly growth is not enough to justify its current PEG ratio .... Analyst
Daniel Ives increases his price target on Apple shares to $350. ... Already one of Apple's (NASDAQ:AAPL) most bullish Street
analysts, Wedbush ... of those handsets are "currently in the window of an upgrade opportunity. ... Loup Ventures' Gene
Munster similarly believes the device could be .... Apple (NASDAQ:AAPL) made believers of investors again last year. ...
Those beliefs have fueled the resurgence in Apple stock, which ... Loup Ventures managing partner Gene Munster, a well-
respected Apple follower, has ... Munster's price target for Apple is $350 for 2020, 15% higher than current levels.
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